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Resolution No. 90-25

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of April 8, 2025 with full
board present.

Mr. Joe Antram moved that the following resolution be adopted:
RE: AWARD BID FOR 2025 VARIOUS COUNTY PAVEMENT MARKINGS-ENGINEER
WHEREAS, bids were received on April 1, 2025, for the 2025 Various County Road Pavement Markings, and

WHEREAS, three bids were received from Aero Mark, Inc. in the amount of $81,292,00, JD Striping Services,
Inc. in the amount of 122,347.00, Oglesby Construction, Inc. in the amount of $92,368.50, and

WHEREAS, the bids have been reviewed by the Logan County Engineer Office and a recommendation has been
made to award the bid to Aero-Mark, Inc., 10423 Danner Dr., Streetshoro, Ohio 44241 in the amount of $81,292.00 and

enter into a contract for same.

THEREFORE, BE I'T HEREBY RESOLVED, by the Logan County Board of Commissioners to award the bid to
Aero-Mark, Inc., in the amount of $81,292.00 and enter into contract for same.

Mr. Greg Fitzpatrick seconded the motion.

Roll call resulted as follows:

Mr. aichael E. Y-;éer, President g
Mr. 506 'fAntram, ice President {;

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of April §, 2025.

De De Doss, Administrative Clerk




OFFICE OF THE
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER
P.O. BOX 427
1991 COUNTY ROAD 13
BELLEFONTAINE, OH 43311

www.lceo.us

SCOTT C. COLEMAN, P.E., P.S. Telephone: (937) 592-2791
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER Fax: (937) 599-2658
April 4, 2025

The Honorable Board of Recelved

Logan County Commissioners
117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100
Bellefontaine, OH 43311 Logan County

Commissioners
Re: 2025 Various County Road Pavement Markings

April 1,2025 - 10:30 A.M.

Gentlemen:

I have reviewed the bids received on the above item and the bid tabulation is listed below,

Company : _ Bid i
Aero-Mark, Inc. $81,292.00
JD Striping & Services, Inc.  $122,347.00
Oglesby Construction, Inc._ ] .. : $92,368.50

Therefore, we recommend that your honorable board award the bid to the low bidder as follows:
Aero-Mark, Inc., 10423 Danner Dr, Streetsboro, Ohio 44241 in the amount of Eighty-one
thousand, two hundred ninety-two dollars, and zero cents ($81,292.00) and enter into a contract

for same.

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for
Recovery Database and the federal system for awards management. Dura Mark, Inc. was not listed

and we have retained the certified search confirmation page in the project file.
This will be from local Auto & Gas Funds.

Respectfully submitted, APPROVED BY THE RGARD OF
LOGAY OUNTY COMMISSIONERS

/4”2%//5 | MOTION__ }k -

ZND

Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S. PER RE\OLL.ICN# 7?0 (;’»35*
Logan County Engineer DATED Ig 5C

SCClsj




General Info

Total:
$81,292.00

Number

2025 Logan County Pavement
Markings

Deadline

04/01/2025 10:30 AM EDT
Vendor

The Aero-Mark Company LLC
Submitted

04/01/2025 09:15 AM EDT
Signed by

Mike Krenn

Opened

04/01/2025 10:34 AM EDT By
mkerns@]lceo.us

Description

The Logan County Engineer's Office is accepting bids for the repainting, and painting of
new pavement markings on various county roads.

Allows zero unit prices and labor

Yes

Allows negative unit prices and labor

Yes
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ATTACHMENT LIST

2025 County PM NTB.pdf (237 KB)

2025 County PM General Conditions.pdf (362 KB)
2025 County PM Details.pdf (196 KB)

2025 County PM Quantities.pdf (165 KB)

2025 PM prevailing Wage.pdf (4.96 MB)

MT-099.20_2019-04-19.pdf (489 KB)
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ADDENDUM

Addendum Acknowledgement: (Click "+" to add additional fields) (Type "N/A" if not applicable)
Addendum Number: *

n/a

Addendum Date: *

n/a
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AFFIDAVIT - CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTIONS

Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(l) requires that no agency or department of this state or any political
subdivision shall award any contract, other than one let by competitive bidding or a contract incidental to
such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase of goods costing more than five hundred
dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to any individual, partnership, association,
including, without limitation, a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC, estate,
or trust if the individual has made or the individual's spouse has made, or any partner, shareholder,
administrator, executor, or trustee or the spouse of any of them has made, as an individual, within the two
previous calendar years, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder
of the public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer’'s
campaign committee. Furthermore, Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(J) requires that no agency or
department of this state or any political subdivision shall award any contract, other than one let by
competitive bidding or a contract incidental to such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase
of goods costing more than five hundred dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to a
corporation or business trust, except a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC,
if an owner of more than twenty per cent of the corporation or business trust or the spouse of that person
has made, as an individual, within the two previous calendar years, taking into consideration only owners
for all of that period, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder of a
public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer's campaign
committee. Execution of this proposal on the signature portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this
Campaign Contributions Affidavit.
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AFFIDAVIT - NON-COLLUSION

In accordance with Title 23 United States Code, Section 112 and Ohio Revised Code, Chapter 1331 et. seq: and Sections 2921.11
and 2921.13, the bidder hereby states, under penalty of perjury and under other such penalties as the law provides, that he or his
agents or employees have not entered either directly or indirectly into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise
taken any action in restraint of free competitive bidding in connection with this proposal. Execution of this proposal on the
signature portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this Non-Collusion Affidavit.
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PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX

ONE OF THE FOUR FOLLOWING COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT TABS MUST BE
COMPLETED.
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. ss!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP
DBA

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. 88!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

of: *

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - PARTNERSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. 88!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

known as: *
No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - CORPORATION

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. 88!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

[#He is a duly authorized officer of the corporation

*

named: *

The Aero-Mark Company LLC

The business address of the bidder is: *

500 Lena Dr., Aurora, OH 44202

Telephone: *
(330) 995-0100

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *

Was not charged with any delinquient personal taxes in Logan County, Ohio.

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click “+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
n/a $.00 $.00 $.00

Signature: *

Curtis Britton

Title: *

president
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BIDDER INFORMATION

Company *
The Aero-Mark Company LLC

Submitted by *
Curtis Britton

Street, Post Office, City, State and Zip: *
500 Lena Dr., Aurora, OH 44202

E-Mail *

support@aeromarkcompany.com

Telephone *
(330) 995-0100

Federal Tax ID# *
87-2080557

Page 11 of 15 04/03/2025



ITEM LIST

$81,292.00
Item Code Description Quantity Units Unit Price Extension
10 Centerline 119  Miles $464.00 $55,216.00
20 Edgeline 40 Miles $543.00 $21,720.00
30 Index Markings 26  Miles $50.00 $1,300.00
8" Wide White
40 Channelizing 431 Feet $1.00 $431.00
White waterborne
50 traffic paint 30 5 gallon buckets $75.00 $2,250.00
60 Glass beads 750 Pounds $0.50 $375.00

Page 12 of 15

Total: $81,292.00
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REQUIRED DOCUMENTS LIST

Name Omission Terms Submitted
File

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's
Check | have electranically verified my bid bond in the Logan
Please upload a copy of your paper bid bond "Bid Bond" section above. bond.pdf
here.

. . . . . . COC -
Certificate of Compliance with Affirmative Action
Program 202502-19798
Issued by the State EEO Coordinator dated prior | Wil furnish prior to contract award MT?F? c/; o
to the date fixed for the opening of bid LLaC pdfompany

Ohio workers’ compensation certificate of
coverage 1 will furnish prior to contract award BWC 24-25.pdf

Submitted prior to contract execution

3 Required Documents
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BID GUARANTY

As specified in the Ohio Revised Code 153.54, a bidder must submit a bid guaranty in the form of either:
(1) a paper contract bond for the full amount (100%) of the bid, or

(2) a certified check, cashier's check, or letter of credit in the amount of 10% of the bid.

(3) an electronic bid bond for 10% of the bid.

Bond Percentage
10.00%

Guarantee Method *

Paper Bid Bond, Certified
Check, Cashier's Check,

Letter of Credit, or Paper
Contract Bond

[7]l understand that original, wet-ink bid guaranty documents will be received “within three days post bid
deadline.”

*

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's Check, Letter of Credit, or Paper Contract Bond

Confirmation *

I have provided a Contract Bond for 100.00% of the bid total amount and have uploaded a
copy in the Required Documents List at the bottom of this solicitation.
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BIDDERS CERTIFICATION:

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby certify to and agree to all the
required contract provisions and documents outlined within the final plans, wage rates, utility notes, proposal notes, and
bidders notices each furnished in their entirety within the attachment list above.

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby agrees to furnish all labor,
materials, and equipment for the (project listed in the general info section) and perfaorm all work incident thereto in accordance
with the plans and specifications thereof and subject to the satisfaction and acceptance by the County Engineer at the unit

prices provided on the proceeding pages.

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby agrees to enter into a contract
within ten (10) days; to complete the said improvement and will furnish the required bond for the payment of all bills for

damages, labor, and material arising from the construction of said improvement.

Signature of Authorized Officer: *
Curtis Britton
Date: _/ [ _I*

4/01/25

Title: *

president
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BID GUARANTY AND
CONTRACT BOND

(SECTION 153.571 Ohio Revised Code)

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, that we, the undersigned
The Aerg-Mark Company, LLC, 500 Lena Dr., Aurora, OH 44202
] (Name and Address)
as Principal and XL Specialty Insurance Company
(Name of Surety)
as Surety, are hereby held and firmly bound unto Logan County Commissioners

as Obligee in the penal sum of the dollar amount of

the bid submitted by the Principal to the Obligee on April 1, 2025 to undertake the project known as:

2025 Logan County Pavement Marking Program

The penal sum teferred to herein shall be the dollar amount of the Principal’s bid to the Obligee, incorporating
any additive or deductive alternate proposals made by the Principal on the date referred to above to the Obligee, which are
accepted by the Obligee. In no case shall the penal sum exceed the amount of dollars
( ). (If the above line is not filled in, the penal sum will be the full amount of the Principal’s bid,
including alternates. Alternatively, if the blank is filled in, the amount stated must not be less than the full amount of the
bid, including alternates, in dollars and cents. A percentage is not acceptable.) For the payment of the penal sum well and
truly to be made, we hereby jointly and severally bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators, successors, and

assigns.

THE CONDITION OF THE ABOVE OBLIGATION IS SUCH, that whereas the above named Principal has
submitted a bid on the above referenced project;

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Obligee accepts the bid of the Principal and the Principal fails to enter into a proper
contract in accordance with the bid, plans, details, specifications, and bills of material; and in the event the Principal pays
to the Obligee the difference not to exceed ten percent of the penalty hereof between the amount specified in the bid and
such larger amount for which the Obligee may in good faith contract with the next lowest bidder to perform the work
covered by the bid; or in the event the Obligee does not award the contract to the next lowest bidder and resubmits the
project for bidding, the Principal pays to the Obligee the difference not to exceed ten percent of the penalty hereof
between the amount specified in the bid, or the costs, in connection with the resubmission, of printing new contract
documents, required advertising and printing and mailing notices to prospective bidders, whichever is less, then this
obligation shall be null and void, otherwise to remain in full force and effect; if the Obligee accepts the bid of the
Principal and the Principal within ten days after the awarding of the contract, enters into a proper contract in accordance
with the bid, plans, details, specifications, and bills of material, which said contract is made a part of this bond the same as
though set forth herein; and

Page 1 of 2
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IF THE SAID Principal shall well and faithfully do and perform each and every condition of such contract; and
indemnify the Obligee against all damage suffered by failure to perform such contract according to the provisions thereof
and in accordance with the plans, details, specifications, and bills of material therefore; and shall pay all lawful claims of
subcontractors, materialmen, and laborers, for labor performed and materials furnished in the carrying forward,
performing, or completing of said contract; we agreeing and assenting that this undertaking shall be for the benefit of any
materialman or laborer having a just claim; as well as for the Obligee herein; then this obligation shall be void; otherwise
the same shall remain in full force and effect; it being expressly understood and agreed that the liability of the Surety for
any and all claims hereunder shall in no event exceed the penal amount of this obligation as herein stated.

THE SAID Surety hereby stipulates and agrees that no modifications, omission, or additions, in or to the terms of
the said contract or in or to the plans or specifications therefor shall in any wise affect the obligations of said Surety on its
bond, and it does hereby waive notice of any such modifications, omissions or additions to the terms of the contract or to

the work or to the specifications.

SIGNED AND SEALED this 1st  dayof April 5 2025
PRINCIPAL:
The Aero-Mark Company. LL.C
By:
Title: Aur(‘b BH‘HDI); Pre eSident™
SURETY: SURETY COMPANY ADDRESS:
XL Specialty insurance Company 677 Washington Blv., 10th Floor, Suite 100
* Street
Laura Kneiiz orney-in-Fact Stamford CT 06901
City State Zip
(203) 964-5200
Telephone
SURETY AGENT’S ADDRESS:
_Lockton
Agency Name
3657 Briarpark Dr, Suite 700
Street
Houston TX 77042
City State Zip
(713) 458-5200
Telephone

NOTE: Failure by any party to sign Bid Guaranty and Contract Bond shall result in rejection of bid.

Page 2 of 2
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Docusign Envelope ID: 6BECAA13-C817-4A62-81FB-C85285FBE343

Power of Attorn:
P p s THIS IS NOT A BOND NUMBER

Greenwich Insurance Company LIMITED POWER OF ATTORNEY

A ; A XL 1631664

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That XL Speclalty Insurance Company, and Greenwith Insurance Company, both Delaware
Insurance companties with offices located at 505 Eagleview Bivd., Exton, PA 19341, do hereby nominate, constitute, and appolnt:

ﬂmoﬂ:rﬁﬂaﬂ»nabartﬁBoba,ﬂonnuncd«lhlymﬂnmrlfmmnndmﬁhdtdm&Tmb.l(cﬂy,
Layra Kneftz
achltstrueandlawﬂ:!Mtomey(s)-ln—factbomke,exemte,attst,sealanddeﬂverforandonﬂsbeha!f,assurety,andasltsactand
md,wherereq&ed,anymdaﬂbondsandunde:takmgsinﬂ\enamrem:md,formepennlmmefnoomofwhld\lsmanyeventm
excead $150,000,000.00.

Sudmbondsmdummklngs,whendwymeamdbymeafnma}dmm(s)-m-FactshaﬂbeblndlnguponeadlsaldCompanyas
Mlyandmthesameextentaslfmmm;andurldemwngswemsignedbymePrlsidemmdSeamWﬁfmeOamanyadeed
with its corporate seal.

The Power of Attorney Is granted and Is signed by facsimile under and by the authority of the following Resolutions adopted by the Board
of Directors of each of the Companies on the 18th day of September 2024,

RESOLVED,MErchonoﬁ-lo.DaveMgulm,UanPtma,.‘rhnRldwertandKevin&ﬂrsﬁmherebyappomdbyureBoardasaummzedm
make,uecuee,malanddeﬂverforandonbehaffofﬂretanperw,anymdaﬂbonds,undermklngs,mnmorobﬁgauonsmwetyor
m-suretywtmoﬁtemandmatﬁseSeuetaryoranyAsﬁsuntSeq’ehryofmeCompanybeandmateadlcfthemhﬂebytsauﬂmlzedto
attest the execstion of any such bonds, undertekings, contracts or obligations In surety or co-surely and atiach thereto the ocorporate seal

of the Company.
RESOLVED, FURTHER, that Erc Donofio. Dave Maguire, Lian PhuaJim Richert and Kevin Mirsch each Is hereby authorized to execute powers

ofamnnymwﬂ!yingﬂnamaynamedinmegmpa«aofmgymmm,mbdralfofﬂnCompany,bondsandundahkhgsh
suretyoroo-suelywlmm,mdmatﬁteSeaetaworanythSeamwofmeCwnpmybe,mdmatead\ofmemlshereby
suthorized to attest the execution of any such power of attorney, and to attach thereto the corporate seal of the Company.
RESOLVED,mm&mﬁndgmnfmmmmedmﬂnprﬂdlngremtuﬁomandmeoorporatesealofﬂnmmpanymaybe
mwmmpowersofammeyormanywﬁﬁaherehﬂngmmbyracdmue,utdanymeofumyorwﬁnatebeadng
suchfaa[mﬂeslgnahresorfaslnﬂlesealﬁaﬂbe&em&tvaﬂdaﬂb&ndﬁuuponmeConmanyvdﬂzrupecttoanybond,mdertakhg,
contract or obligation in surety or co-surety with others to which It Is attached.
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the XL SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY and GREENWICH INSURANCE COMPANY has caused Its corporate seal
to be hereunto affixed, and these presents to be signed by its duly authorized officers this February 18th, 2025,
XL SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY
GREENWICH INSURANCE COMPANY

by: MMMA;,\__Q

Kevin M, Mirsch, SECRETARY

STATE OF PENNSYLVANIA - -
COUNTY OF CHESTER Aupest: A E A

David Magulre, ASSISTANT SECRETARY

Onmlslsthdayand)mary,zozs,befﬁemepersonaﬂycamekevlansd]mmeknown,who,belnaddyswm,dddeposeand
say: that he Is Secretary of XL SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY and GREENWICH INSURANCE COMPANY, described in and which
executed the above instument; that he knows the seals of said Companies; that the seals affixed to the aforesald instrument I
sudnmrporatesealsandwerean‘ixedH)eretobyo:defandauﬁmrltyofﬁveBoarﬁsofDlrectorsofsaldCompanla;andthathe

executed the sald instrument by like order.

Rebecca C. Shathoub, NOTARY PUBLIC

STATE OF PENNSYLVANIA

COUNTY OF CHESTER

1, David Maguire, Assistant Secretary of XL SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY and GREENWICH INSURANCE COMPANY, corporations of
the State of Delaware, do hereby certify that the above and forgolng Is a full, true and correct copy of a Power of Attorney issued by said
Companles, and that I have compared same with the original and that it Is & comert wansoript therefrom and of the whole of the original
and that the sald Power of Attorney Is.still In full force and effect and has not been revoked.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and =affixed the seal of said Corporation, at the Cty of Stamford, this E day of
March, 2025

g/

David Maguire, ASSISTANT SECRETARY

This Power of Attorney may not be used bo execute any bond with an inception date after 2/18/2027

SB0041



Office of Risk Assessment i ““%i0hlo Department of Insurance

50 West Town Street A
Third Floor - Suite 300 “eo Lt MieDeWine - Goveror
Columbus,Ohio 43215 ' Bl o . B

(614)644-2658 Judith French - Director
il g i Certificate of Compliance

www.insurance.ohio.gov

Issued 03/14/2024

Effective 04/02/2024
Expires 04/01/2025

I, Judith French, hereby cettify that I am the Director of Insurance in the State of Ohio and have supervision of
insurance business in said State and as such 1 hereby certify that

XL SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY

of Delaware is duly organized under the laws of this State and is authorized to transact the business of insurance
under the following section(s) of the Ohio Revised Code:

Section 3929.01 (A)

Aircraft Ocean Marine

Allied Lines Other

Boiler & Machinery Other Liability

Burglary & Theft Private Passenger Auto - Liability
Commercial Auto - Liability Private Passenger Auto - No Fault
Commercial Auto - No Fault Private Passenger Auto - Physical Damage
Commercial Auto - Physical Damage Surety

Credit Workers Compensation
Earthquake

Fidelity

Fire

Glass

Inland Marine

Medical Malpractice

Multiple Peril - Commercial
Multiple Peril - Farmowners
Mutltiple Peril - Homeowners

L E CO certified in its annual statement to this Department as of December
31, 2022 that it has admitted assets in the amount of $3,501,261,018, liabilities in the amount of $2,889,635,943, and
surplus of at least $611,625,075.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto subscribed my name and caused my seal to be affixed at Columbus, Ohio,
this day and date.

St L. Fronet—

Judith French, Director

INS7230(Rev.6/2003) Accredited by the National Association of Insurance Commissloners (NAIC)



XL SPECIALTY INSURANCE COMPANY

STATUTORY STATEMENT OF ADMITTED ASSETS,

Assets:

Bonds

Stocks

Cash and short-term invesiments
Receivable for securities

Total Invested Assets

Agents Balances

Funds held by or deposited with reinsured
companies

Reinaurance recoverable on loss and loss
adjustment expense payments

Accrued interest and dividends

Other admitted assets

Total Admitted Assets

LIABILITIES, CAPITAL AND SURPLUS

December 31, 2023
(U.S. Dollars)

2,804,366,699
127,261,802
450,893,384

19,6887

3,962,541,772

277,268,035

3,238,083

15,749,508

111,196,865

3,789,994,283

Liabilities:

Loss & loss adjusiment expenses

Reinsurance payable on paid loss and loss
adjustment expenses

Unearned premiums

Ceded reinsurance premium payable

Funds held by company under reinsurance
troaties

Payable for Securities
Other Liabilities

Total Liabilities

Capital and Surplus:

Aggregate write-ins for special
surplus funds

Common capital Stock

Gross paid in and contributed surplus
Unassigned surplus

Total Capital and Surplus

Total Liabilities, Capital and Surplus

1,717,5698,275
502,884
442,720,116
0

740,348,477

153,963,663

93,055,128,415

5,812,500

609,192,647

119,859,701

734,864,848

3,789,994,263

I, Andrew Robert Will, Vice President and Controller of XL Specialty insurance Company (the "Corporation”) do hereby certify
that to the best of my knowledge and belief, the foregoing is a full and true Statutory Statement of Admitted Assets, Liabilities,
Capital and Suiplus of the Corporation, as of December 31, 2023, prepared in conformity with the accounting practices
prascribed or permitted by the Insurance Department of the State of Delawars. The foregoing statement should not be taken
as a complete statement of financial condition of the Corporation. Such a statement is aveilable upon request at the

Corporation's principal office located at 677 Washington Bivd., 10 Floor, Suite 1000, Stamford, CT 06901.

fotoceilotes

Andrew Robent Will
Vice President and Controller



Development Mike DeWine, Governor Jon Husted, Lt. Governor Lydia Mihalik, Director

r\./] Department of Development.Ohio.gov
iy

March 11, 2025

Courtney Petersen,
HR/Payroll Manager

The Aero Mark Company LLC
500 Lena Drive

Aurora, OH 44202

SUBJECT: Certificate of Compliance Certification
Status: In Compliance
Effective Dates: March 11, 2025 - September 11, 2025

Dear Courtney Petersen:

The Ohio Department of Development, Minority Business Development Division (MBDD) hereby issues The
Aero Mark Company LLC a Certificate of Compliance. The Certificate shall be in force for 180 days from the
date of issuance.

Section 9.47 of the Revised Code requires MBDD to review affirmative action programs and plans of each
company desiring to participate on state or state-assisted construction contracts and determine whether that
company has violated any affirmative action programs and goals for which that company was obligated to
meet during the preceding five years. Based on the above-referenced review, MBDD has found no such
violation(s).

Please be advised that for The Aero Mark Company LLC to maintain certification status, The Aero Mark
Company LLC must continue to ensure equal employment opportunities in accordance with applicable state
and federal EEO laws, rules, regulations, guidelines, and meet those contractual obligations for which The Aero
Mark Company LLC has agreed.

Sincerely,

Monica L. Womack
Chief



. Buresis of Workers’ 30 W. Spring St.
Compensation Columbus, OH 43215

Certificate of Ohio Workers' Compensation
This certifies that the employer listed below participates in the Ohio State Insurance Fund as required by law.
Therefore, the employer is entitled to the rights and benefits of the fund for the period specified. This certificate
is only valid if premiums and assessments, including installments, are paid by the applicable due date. To
verify coverage, visit www.bwc.ohio.gov, or call 1-800-644-6292.

This certificate must be conspicuously posted.

Policy number and empioyer Period Specified Bslow
00926437 - 07/01/2024 to 07/01/2025

The Aero-Mark Company LLC
10423 DANNER DR
STREETSBORO OH 44241-5071

www.bwe.ohio.gov
|ssued by: BWC

Administrator/CEQ

You can reproduce this certificate as needed,

Ohio Bureau of Workers' Compensation

Required Posting

Section 4123.54 of the Ohio Revised Code requires notice of
rebuttable presumption. Rebuttable presumption means an
employee may dispute or prove untrue the presumption (or
belief) that alcohol, marihuana or a controlled substance not
prescribed by the employee's physician is the proximate cause
(main reason) of the work-related injury.

The burden of proof is on the employee to prove the presence of
alcohol, marihuana or a controlled substance was not the
proximate cause of the work-related injury. An employee who
tests positive or refuses to submit to chemical testing may be
disqualified for compensation and benefits under the Workers'
Compensation Act.

You must post this {anguage with the Certificate of Ohio Workers’ Compensation.

DP-29 BWC-1628 (Rev. Jan. 10, 2019)
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